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SUMMARY OF FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUESTS 
 

1 July to 30 September 2013 
 

Ref Request Response 
24/13 I would like a list of all the expenses claimed by the PCC or staff working 

for them since they were voted into the position. This includes what 
expense was claimed, where it was claimed, when it was claimed, how 
much was claimed and for what reason it was claimed. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
I would also like a list of transaction on credit cards made by the PCC or 
staff since the start of the job. This includes what expense was claimed, 
where it was claimed, when it was claimed, how much was claimed and 
for what reason it was claimed. 
 
I would also like to know if any accommodation has been provided for the 
PCC, whether this is permanent or temporary. This includes where the 
accommodation is, how much it costs to maintain/for the PCC to stay 

Details of expenses claimed by the Police and Crime and 
Commissioner since taking office are published on the 
Commissioner’s website and can be accessed using the following 
link: http://www.lincolnshire-pcc.gov.uk/Transparency/Information-
about-the-Police-and-Crime-Commissioner.aspx 
 
Expenses claimed by individual members of staff working within the 
Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner for the period 22 
November 2011 to 16 June 2013 are detailed in the spreadsheet 
attached at Appendix A to this Summary. Entries have been 
anonymised to avoid breaching Data Protection rules on handling 
personal data. 
 
The Police and Crime Commissioner has not been issued with a 
credit card for business purposes since taking office. 
 
A list of transactions for credit cards issued for business purposes to 
the Police and Crime Commissioner’s Chief Executive and Chief 
Finance Officer for the period 22 November 2012 to 30 May 2012 is 
attached at Appendix B to this Summary. 
 
No private accommodation has been provided to the Police and 
Crime Commissioner since taking office.  Permanent office space 
has been provided for the Commissioner and members of his staff 
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there, how long the PPC plans to stay there. 
 
 
Finally, I would like a list of people that have received payments from the 
PCC office. This includes contracted staff, non-contracted staff, 
consultants and other payments to individuals or groups. 
 

within Lincolnshire Police Headquarters, Deepdale Lane, Nettleham, 
Nr Lincoln. There is no charge levied for using this accommodation. 
 
The names of salaried staff employed within the Office of the Police 
and Crime Commissioner can be accessed using the following link: 
http://www.lincolnshire-pcc.gov.uk/Document-Library/Organisation-
Structure-v3.pdf 
 
The names of groups/organisations that have (to date) been offered 
grants from the Police and Crime Commissioner’s Community and 
Voluntary Fund 2013-14 can be accessed using the following link: 
http://www.lincolnshire-pcc.gov.uk/Document-Library/022---scanned-
version.pdf 
 
To date, no other persons (including contracted staff, non-contracted 
staff, consultants or other individuals/groups) have received 
payments from the Police and Crime Commissioner’s own 
departmental budget since 22 November 2013. 
 
Whilst not directly relevant to your information request you may 
nevertheless be interested in using the following link to access 
expenditure on invoices over £500 (net of VAT):  
http://www.lincolnshire-pcc.gov.uk/Finance/Expenditure-over-
500.aspx 
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25/13 I would like the total number of arrests made in the constabulary 
catchment area since 2009 for the following offences: 

• Rape 

• Sexual assault 

• Administering a substance (drinks spiking) 

• Trepass with intent to commit a sexual offence 

• Sexual intercourse with a girl under the age of 16 

• Abuse of trust through a sexual activity 

• Sexual activity by a care worker 

• Engaging in a sexual activity in the presence of a child 

• Sexual grooming 

• Sexual activity with a family member 

• Abudction  

• Indecent conduct towards a child 

• Taking an indecent photograph of a child 

• Causing or inciting child prostitution 

• Procuring a woman by threats or false pretences 

• Trafficking a person into the UK for sexual exploitation 

• Exposure 

• Voyeurism  

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 

26/13 How many former Police Authority staff have been made redundant or 
taken voluntary exit since November 2012? 
 
What is the total amount given to them in voluntary exit payments, 
redundancy pay, severance payments, lump sums, payments in lieu of 
notice, compensation awards and pension payments? 
 
What is the single highest payment made to a former Police Authority 
employee? 
 
How many of them signed confidentiality clauses as part of their 
departure? 

None. 
 
 
Not applicable. 
 
 
 
Not applicable. 
 
 
Not applicable. 
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Have any former Police Authority employees since been re-employed by 
the OPCC? 

No. 
 

27/13 Road death investigation 

• Road death investigation budget 

• Number of Collision Investigators 
 
Life threatening/changing injury collision investigation 

• We believe collision investigators are also responsible for 
investigating life threatening/changing injuries. Please confirm or 
correct this. If known, please give the number of non-fatal 
collisions that collision investigators had to investigate in the last 
year.  

 
Homicide 

• Homicide budget 

• Number of homicide detectives 
 

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 

28/13 1.A list of trade unions which received payments from your organisation 
and the total amounts paid to each union for financial years a) 2011-12 
and b) 2012-13. If it is not possible to list the amount paid to each union, 
please provide a total amount paid to all unions. Please do not include 
membership dues or salary costs. Please only include direct payments. 

2. Please state: 
a) Which trade unions your organisation provide staff time to work on 
trade union duties and / or activities (sometimes called ‘Trade Union 
facility time’) in i) 2011-12 and ii) 2012-13. 

b) The number of full-time equivalent (FTE) staff that were provided for 
each trade union in i) 2011-12 and ii) 2012-13. For example, if a member 
of staff spends 2 days per week on union business, this is equal to 0.4 
FTE. 

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 
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3. 

a) Does your organisation provide the facility to deduct trade union 
subscriptions from staff salaries in the payroll process? 

b) If so, for each union please state what your organisation charged for 
this service (whether as a fixed amount per employee or a percentage), 
and the total amount collected in: 

i) 2011-12 

ii) 2012-13 

 

29/13 Does (or has) our Chief Constable received any payments from ACPO for 
services rendered? 
 
 
Does the Lincolnshire Force benefit from any Info/Statistics that the 
ACPO sells to private Companies? 
 

Temporary Chief Constable Neil Rhodes does not and has not 
received any payments from the Association of Chief Police Officers 
(ACPO) for services rendered. 
 

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 

30/13 How much has your office, and the Police Authority before it, paid in 
general contributions to the Association of Chief Police Officers (ACPO) in 
each of the past three financial years, 2010-11, 2011-12 and 2012-13? If 
possible, please also state how much you expect to pay in the current 
financial year. 
 
How much has your office, and the Police Authority before it, paid to 
cover chief officers’ subscriptions to the Chief Police Officers’ Staff 
Association (CPOSA) or ACPO, in each of the past three financial years? 
 
How much has your office, and the Police Authority before it, paid to 
towards the ACPO Criminal Records Office (ACRO), in each of the past 
three financial years? 
 

Neither the former Police Authority nor the Police and Crime 
Commissioner for Lincolnshire made any contributions to the 
Association of Chief Police Officers (ACPO) for the period 2010-11, 
2011-12 and 2012-13. 
 
 
Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 
 
 
Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 
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How much has your office, and the Police Authority before it, paid to 
towards the Police National Information Co-ordination Centre (PNICC), in 
each of the past three financial years? If possible, please also state how 
much you expect to pay towards its successor organisation, the National 
Police Co-ordination Centre, this year. 
 
How much money has your office, and the Police Authority, received from 
the National Driver Offender Retraining Scheme (NDORS), in each of the 
past three financial years? Have you paid NDORS and its related 
organisations, NDORS Ltd, RSS Ltd and R&SC Ltd, any money? 
 
Please set out any other money you have paid to ACPO and related 
organisations in the past three financial years. These may include ACPO 
Crime Prevention Initiatives Ltd, the National Ballistic Intelligence Service, 
ACPO Terrorism and Allied Matters (TAM), the National Wildlife Crime 
Unit, ACPO conferences etc. 
 

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 
 
 
 
 
Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 
 
 
 
Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 

31/13 Number of a) police officers and b) police vehicles that have been 
attacked by members of the public.  Please could you provide this data for 
each of the past 10 years. 
 

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 

32/13 I wish to know how much your Force has spent on artwork for its police 
stations and any offices associated with your Force over the last five 
years. Please specify what the artwork is. For example is it a painting or a 
sketch or a sculpture?  Please include any water features and fish tanks 
too. 
 
Where possible, please name the artist and specify how much was paid 
for the artwork and when it was bought and where it is now kept. 
 
Please specify any upkeep costs, for example, if your Force has 
purchased a fish tank then please state the upkeep for the tank. 
 

Information not held by the Police and Crime Commissioner for 
Lincolnshire. 

 


